Project Name: 2018 Local MFT Street Improvement, County Fair Drive
Engineer's Estimate Dunn Company, Reyhan Bros., Inc. DBA Feutz Contractors, Inc. Otto Baum Co., Inc.
Project Number: 2018-26 A Division of Tyrolt, Inc. [pngamo Construction Comp4 PO Box 130 866 N. Main St
724 N Mercer St 2100 East Moffet Avenue 1120 N Main St Morton, IL 61550
City Engineering Division Decatur, IL 62522 Springfield, IL 62702 Paris, IL 61944
IBid Date: Thursday, July 26, 2018 PH: 309-266-7114
PH: 217-429-4444 Ph: 217-544-9871 PH: 217-465-8402
Time: 10:00 A.M.
David W. Tyrolt, Pres. Allan Reyan, Jr., Pres. |John S Blair, Chairman/CE( Terry L. Baum, Pres.
Fund: Local MFT David E Wright, Pres.
david.tyrolt@dunnco.com office@sangamo.net steve@feutzcontractors.com|ladamwatson@ottobaum.comny
Organization Code: 42484206
Object Code: 489070
Y — —Y—— R —— T e e e Fee——— [ ———
Number Pay Item QTYy Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
21101505|[TOPSOIL EXCAVATION 204/ CUYD $6.00 $1,224.00 $5.62 $1,146.48 $9.58 $1,954.32 $5.00 $1,020.00 $11.18 $2,280.72
21101505||TOPSOIL PLACEMENT 184][ CUYD $6.00 $1,104.00 $7.51 $1,381.84 $12.52 $2,303.68 $9.00 $1,656.00 $22.63 $4,163.92
25000200||SEEDING, CLASS 2 0,24" ACRE $6,000.00 $1,440.00 $13,125.00 $3,150.00| $32,029.63 $7,687.11|| $13,000.00 $3,120.00f| $19,541.29 $4,689.91
30103000||SHAPING AND GRADING ROADWAY 4,578" SQYD $7.50] $34,335.00 $4.00| $18,312.00) $1.33 $6,088.74 $0.90 $4,120.20 $2.18 $9,980.04f
30200650"PROCESSING MODIFIED SOIL, 12 INCH 4,578" SQYD $10.00| $45,780.00 $10.25| $46,924.50) $10.85| $49,671.30 $7.80| $35,708.40 $12.47| $57,087.66]
35200500"CEMENT 5,093" 100 WT $8.50| $43,290.50 $6.62| $33,715.66) $7.01| $35,701.93 $7.40| $37,688.20 $7.30| $37,178.90)
440001 OO"PAVEMENT REMOVAL 4,456" SQYD $12.00|] $53,472.00 $12.60 $56,145.60" $15.88| $70,761.28 $9.00| $40,104.00] $11.22| $49,996.32
44000500"COMBINATION CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER REMOVAL 1,539“ FOOT $10.00|] $15,390.00 $7.27 $11,188.53" $4.83 $7,433.37 $5.00 $7,695.00 $2.76 $4,247.64)
440031 OO"MEDIAN REMOVAL 381" SQFT $5.00 $1,905.00) $2.29 $872.49 $14.67 $5,589.27 $1.00 $381.00) $4.36 $1,661.16]
542A5497||PIPE CULVERTS, CLASS A, TYPE 1, 53" X 34" ELLIPTICAL 45“ FOOT $200.00 $9,000.00) $424.66| $19,109.70] $238.33| $10,724.85 $261.00| $11,745.00 $250.86| $11,288.70)
54263242"CONCRETE END SECTION, STANDARD 542011, 42", 1:2 2" EACH $2,000.00 $4,000.00) $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $2,781.62 $5,563.24 $4,800.00 $9,600.00 $1,301.45 $2,602.90)
60235700"INLETS, TYPE A, TYPE 11 FRAME AND GRATE 6|| EACH $3,000.00f $18,000.00] $892.50 $5,355.00 $1,871.86 $11,231.16|| $2,950.00| $17,700.00 $1,477.52 $8,865.12
60500060||REMOVING INLETS 6|| EACH $350.00 $2,100.00) $699.56 $4,197.36 $644.79 $3,868.74] $990.00 $5,940.00 $343.81 $2,062.86)
60603800"COMBINATION CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER, TYPE B-6.12 1,847|| FOOT $20.00| $36,940.00 $31.00|] $57,257.00] $24.96| $46,101.12 $22.00 $40,634.00 $27.94| $51,605.18
63200310||GUARDRAIL REMOVAL 27|| FOOT $9.00 $243.00 $15.20 $410.40 $6.96 $187.92) $14.00 $378.00) $16.95 $457.65)
XO100003[ICLEARING AND GRUBBING 1f| LSUM $5,000.00 $5,000.00) $2,798.25 $2,798.25 $9.35 $9.35 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $6,674.75 $6,674.75
X0300015|[CONCRETE WINGWALL REMOVAL 2|[ EACH $2,000.00 $4,000.00) $1,300.95 $2,601.90) $2,844.85 $5,689.70 $2,000.00 $4,000.00) $216.12 $432.24f
X2800001 "EROSION CONTROL 1f| LSUM $10,000.00] $10,000.00] $7,560.00 $7,560.00) $5,929.45 $5,929.45( $23,000.00 $23,000.00| $10,736.69 $10,736.69|
X2810000||RIPRAP 24| SQ YD $8.50 $204.00 $170.63 $4,095.12 $88.42 $2,122.08| $90.00 $2,160.00 $106.96 $2,567.04]
X7010100|[TRAFFIC CONTROL AND PROTECTION (SPECIAL) 1]| LSUM $2,000.00 $2,000.00] $8,694.00 $8,694.00) $7,561.38 $7,561.38 $6,300.00 $6,300.00|] $39,491.80| $39,491.80
X7830060 gYRSS(\)’I'_';G FORRECESSED PAVEMENT MARKING, LETTERSAND: || p4oll g0y $11.20|  $6,137.60 $6.30|  $3452.40 $6.35|  $3.479.80 $6.50|  $3,562.00 $662|  $3627.76
X7830074||GROOVING FOR RECESSED PAVEMENT MARKING 7" 1,643|| SQFT $1.10 $1,807.30) $4.60 $7,557.80 $4.66 $7,656.38] $4.80 $7,886.40} $4.85 $7,968.55|
X7830090||GROOVING FOR RECESSED PAVEMENT MARKING 25" 244|| SQFT $8.00 $1,952.00) $8.40 $2,049.60 $8.47 $2,066.68 $8.80 $2,147.20] $8.82 $2,152.08)
Z0009000 'é;iERiAV.\r,gglf nEANCELLATIONS; EXTENSIONS; DEDUCTIONS AND 1f| LSUM $70,000.00| $70,000.00|] $70,000.00f $70,000.00{f $70,000.00( $70,000.00|| $70,000.00| $70,000.00f $70,000.00( $70,000.00
"TOTAL BASE BID $369,324.40] $376,375.63 $369,382.85 $341,745.40 $391,819.59]
ALTERNATE A (CONCRETE PAVEMENT)
20200100"EARTH EXCAVATION 250|| CUYD $30.00 $7,500.00 $10.97 $2,742.50 $11.50 $2,875.00 $22.12 $5,530.00)
20400800||FURNISHED EXCAVATION 2,488|| CUYD $40.00 $99,520.00 $23.33] $58,045.04 $36.00 $89,568.00] $21.69| $53,964.72
42000501 ||PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT 10" (JOINTED) 4,578" SQYD $60.00| $274,680.00 $68.18 $312,128.04|| $69.00[ $315,882.00, $66.05| $302,376.90
78005100||EPOXY PAVEMENT MARKING - LETTERS AND SYMBOLS 548|| SQFT $1.32 $723.36 $5.82 $3,189.36) $6.00 $3,288.00] $6.07 $3,326.36
78005130||EPOXY PAVEMENT MARKING - LINES 6" 2,815|| FOOT $1.25 $3,518.75| $2.84 $7,994.60) $3.00 $8,445.00] $2.96 $8,332.40
78005180||EPOXY PAVEMENT MARKING - LINES 24" 117|| FOOT $6.00 $702.00 $11.33 $1,325.61 $11.00 $1,287.00) $11.80 $1,380.60}
"TOTAL ALTERNATE A $386,644.11 NO BID $385,425.15] $421,345.00 $374,910.98|
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ALTERNATE B (ASPHALT PAVEMENT)
202001 OOHEARTH EXCAVATION 504|| CU YD $30.00f $15,120.00 $8.00 $4,032.00
20400800"FURNISHED EXCAVATION 2,420 CUYD $40.00 $96,800.00 $11.00] $26,620.00)
40600290"BITUMINOUS MATERIAL (TACK COAT) 2,060 $0.75 $1,545.00] $1.00 $2,060.00}
40603085"HOT—MIX ASPHALT BINDER COURSE, IL-19, N70 2,416 $88.15| $212,970.40) $85.50| $206,568.00]
40603340||HOT-MIX ASPHALT SURFACE COURSE, MIX "D", N70 635" TON $99.80| $63,373.00 $115.40| $73,279.00]
78000100||THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING, LETTERS AND SYMBOLS 548" SQFT $1.00 $548.00) $5.80 $3,178.40
78000400\ THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING, 6 INCH 2,815|| FOOT $0.60 $1,689.00] $1.45 $4,081.75
78000650\ THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING, 24 INCH 117|| FOOT $4.40 $514.80 $5.50 $643.50]
TOTAL ALTERNATE B $392,560.20) $320,462.65] NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL BASE BIDS (AS CORRECTED) $369,324.40] $376,375.63 $369,382.85 $341,745.40 $391,819.59
Percent Over Under ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 1.91% 0.02% -7.47% 6.09%
ITOTAL BASE BIDS + ALTERNATE A (AS CORRECTED) $755,968.51 NO BID $754,808.00 $763,090.40] $766,730.57
Percent Over Under ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE -0.15% 0.94% 1.42%
TOTAL BASE BIDS + ALTERNATE B (AS CORRECTED) $761,884.60) $696,838.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Percent Over Under ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE, -8.54% I [[ I
- W /67 &
Paul-easwell, P.E., City Enginéér Date
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